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Companies of all kinds have fallen into some of the most fundamental of traps when it comes to consumer
marketing; in assuming that the motivation that drives their customers is entirely rational. Enrico Trevisan's
The Irrational Consumer builds on the ground breaking works on behavioural economics of authors such as
Daniel Kahneman and Richard Thaler in order to explain the fundamental drivers of customer decisions and
how to incorporate these into your business strategy. Learn how consumers respond to different offer
architectures and discounts; why they sometimes struggle to see the wood for the trees in a world of ever-
increasing options; what are the rules of thumb they develop for making sense of value. Behavioural
economics offers organizations perspectives for engaging with customers, whose views on what to buy are
strongly driven by contextual factors, such as the framework and the dynamics of choices. Enrico Trevisan's
The Irrational Consumer is your 'must-have' primer to this world.
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From reader reviews:

Wilma Blue:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this The Irrational Consumer: Applying
Behavioural Economics to Your Business Strategy book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because
this book is usually more than just a book.

Eric Frances:

The experience that you get from The Irrational Consumer: Applying Behavioural Economics to Your
Business Strategy may be the more deep you searching the information that hide inside the words the more
you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but The Irrational
Consumer: Applying Behavioural Economics to Your Business Strategy giving you thrill feeling of reading.
The article author conveys their point in particular way that can be understood by means of anyone who read
the idea because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This book also makes your own vocabulary
increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We highly recommend you for having that The Irrational Consumer: Applying
Behavioural Economics to Your Business Strategy instantly.

Lori Hunt:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for you is The Irrational Consumer: Applying Behavioural Economics to Your Business
Strategy this e-book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This specific book
was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That is why this book ideal all of
you.

Mary Burnette:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Irrational Consumer: Applying
Behavioural Economics to Your Business Strategy can be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know.
You are consequently out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd



activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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