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The entire Dubrovsky family heads to snowy Russia for a family Christmas. Brennen fears Dmitri’s
homophobic father’s rejection. Dmitri believes when they present their daughter, that all will be forgiven, but
steps into a mess upon arriving with his husband. Instead of greeting Dmitri and Brennen with hugs and
kisses, Grandma Dubrovsky whisks baby Dominika away, leaving them alone with Dmitri’s angry father.
Can they stay if it means abiding by his rules?

This is a story of love, forgiveness, and miracles during the holiday season. Dmitri and Brennen overcome
issues which have been troubling their relationship, each growing and learning how to best be what the other
needs. There are many surprises during the holiday season for all of them.

This is best if read after Make Me (Book 3 in the Rent Me series.) If you read it as a standalone, you will
surely wish you had read the first three books.

WARNING:
This is a Gay adult consensual story focused on themes of corporal discipline punishment and explicit sex
between men. Light BDSM
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From reader reviews:

Andrew Comer:

The book For Me: A Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book For Me: A Christmas Story from
the Rent Me Series? Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book
can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or
information that you take for that, you may give for each other; you could share all of these. Book For Me: A
Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for
you. You can search the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Alice Navarro:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is known to us
that book is very important for people. The book For Me: A Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series ended
up being making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is quite
advantages for you. The e-book For Me: A Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also to become your friend when you truly feel bored. You can
spend your spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship together with the book For Me: A
Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series. You never sense lose out for everything should you read some
books.

Daniel Bryant:

The book with title For Me: A Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series contains a lot of information that
you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new information the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to
find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you with new era of the globalization. You
can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Jonathan Baker:

This For Me: A Christmas Story from the Rent Me Series is new way for you who has curiosity to look for
some information since it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more
you know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading this For Me: A Christmas Story from the
Rent Me Series can be the light food for you because the information inside this book is easy to get by
simply anyone. These books build itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in
the e-book web form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is
the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking
for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in
addition to knowledge.
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