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The Westminster Confession of Faith is a Reformed confession of faith, in the Calvinist theological
tradition. Although drawn up by the 1646 Westminster Assembly, largely of the Church of England, it
became and remains the ‘subordinate standard’ of doctrine in the Church of Scotland, and has been
influential within Presbyterian churches worldwide.

In 1643, the English Parliament called upon “learned, godly and judicious Divines”, to meet at Westminster
Abbey in order to provide advice on issues of worship, doctrine, government and discipline of the Church of
England. Their meetings, over a period of five years, produced the confession of faith, as well as a Larger
Catechism and a Shorter Catechism. For more than three centuries, various churches around the world have
adopted the confession and the catechisms as their standards of doctrine, subordinate to the Bible.
The Westminster Shorter Catechism (also known simply as the Shorter Catechism or WSC) was written in
the 1640s by English and Scottish divines. The assembly also produced the Westminster Confession of Faith
and the Westminster Larger Catechism. The three documents are considered by many Protestants to be the
grandest doctrinal statements to come out of the English Reformation. Completed in 1647, it was presented
to the Long Parliament on 14 April 1648.

The purpose of the Shorter Catechism is to educate lay persons in matters of doctrine and belief. The WSC is
in a simple question and answer format to facilitate memorization. Typically, parents and the church would
use the shorter catechism to train their children in the ways of the Lord. New converts are also given the
WSC as well as the Confession of Faith and Holy Scripture to study. Various denominations have used the
Westminster Confession and Catechism to instruct their members.
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From reader reviews:

Fabian Luton:

The book The Westminster Confession of Faith and Westminster Shorter Catechism can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave
a good thing like a book The Westminster Confession of Faith and Westminster Shorter Catechism? A
number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many details for
us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for
that, you may give for each other; you could share all of these. Book The Westminster Confession of Faith
and Westminster Shorter Catechism has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for
you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Doug Herring:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the whole day
to reading a reserve. The book The Westminster Confession of Faith and Westminster Shorter Catechism it is
extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. When you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book.
You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book
has high quality.

Lonnie Hammer:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled The Westminster Confession of Faith and Westminster Shorter Catechism the mind will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can become your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then become one form conclusion and explanation
that will maybe you never get before. The The Westminster Confession of Faith and Westminster Shorter
Catechism giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful
facts for your better life on this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and mind
will likely be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Stella Carpenter:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What
you should do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of



many books in the top list in your reading list is definitely The Westminster Confession of Faith and
Westminster Shorter Catechism. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in
getting precious person. By looking up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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