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"This egregious gap has now been filled to a fare-thee-well by Dawson's book..." - Booklist (Starred)

Lesbian. Bisexual. Queer. Transgender. Straight. Curious. This book is for everyone, regardless of gender or
sexual preference. This book is for anyone who's ever dared to wonder. This book is for YOU.

There's a long-running joke that, after "coming out," a lesbian, gay guy, bisexual, or trans person should
receive a membership card and instruction manual. THIS IS THAT INSTRUCTION MANUAL. You're
welcome.

Inside you'll find the answers to all the questions you ever wanted to ask: from sex to politics, hooking up to
stereotypes, coming out and more. This candid, funny, and uncensored exploration of sexuality and what it's
like to grow up LGBT also includes real stories from people across the gender and sexual spectrums, not to
mention hilarious illustrations.

You will be entertained. You will be informed. But most importantly, you will know that however you
identify (or don't) and whomever you love, you are exceptional. You matter. And so does this book.

One of The Guardian's Best Books of the Year

"The book every LGBT person would have killed for as a teenager, told in the voice of a wise best friend.
Frank, warm, funny, USEFUL." –Patrick Ness, bestselling author
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From reader reviews:

Helen Palmer:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways
to share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the
story how the personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When you read
this This Book Is Gay, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Cheryl Steele:

This Book Is Gay can be one of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away
because this publication has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort that will put
every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing This Book Is Gay but doesn't forget the main place,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one among it.
This great information can easily drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Freddie Valdez:

The book untitled This Book Is Gay contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the girl idea
with easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this.
The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period of literary works. It is
possible to read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the
book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their
official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice study.

Susan Hare:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred to as of book
This Book Is Gay. Contain your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it may add your
knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about guide. It can
bring you from one destination for a other place.
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